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CUSTOMER AUTHORIZATION  
FOR CORE GAS AGGREGATION SERVICE 

 
I hereby authorize Mirabito Natural Gas, LLC d/b/a Evergreen Gas & Electric (Evergreen) to act 
on my behalf and provide natural gas service to me under Pacific Gas & Electric’s (PG&E’s) tariffs 
for Core Gas Aggregation Service, in accordance with the rules and regulations of the California 
Public Utilities Commission (CPUC). I understand that PG&E shall continue to provide gas 
transportation services to me pursuant to its tariffs. 
 
I authorize PG&E to release my current and historical gas usage information, and my billing and 
payment information (including information regarding any negotiated payment plans that I entered 
into with PG&E), to Evergreen. I authorize PG&E to release to Evergreen all the information that 
is necessary for Evergreen to provide Core Gas Aggregation Service under PG&E’s tariffs to the 
PG&E account(s) listed in this Authorization. I understand that this information will assist PG&E 
and Evergreen in providing better customer service. Evergreen is required by the CPUC to keep 
this information secure and confidential at all times.  
 

Under Core Gas Aggregation Service provided by Evergreen, I will continue to be responsible for 
payment of PG&E’s gas transportation charges, even if I authorize PG&E to send information 
about my gas transportation charges to Evergreen. I understand and agree that the CPUC will 
continue to regulate PG&E. I also understand that the CPUC does not regulate Evergreen’s 
pricing under Core Gas Aggregation Service and that I am responsible for any agreement with 
Evergreen for such pricing and service. I understand and agree that Evergreen is not an agent of 
PG&E, and PG&E shall not be liable for any of Evergreen’s acts, omissions or representations 
including any liability resulting from use of information disclosed to Evergreen or others as part of 
this authorization. 
 
Gas Service Accounts 

Customer requests and agrees that Evergreen begin Core Gas Aggregation Service to the 
following PG&E gas account(s). 
 
      GAS SERVICE ADDRESS        PG&E SERVICE AGREEMENT NUMBER 
 
____________________________________    ______________________________________ 

____________________________________    ______________________________________ 

____________________________________    ______________________________________ 

____________________________________    ______________________________________ 

 
I understand that Evergreen’s charges will be appearing on PG&E’s bills and I will continue to 
remit my payments for gas supply service to PG&E. 
 
Customer Signature: 
 
____________________________________________________      ________________ 
               Date  
Print Name: __________________________________________ 


